
From: 
Sent: Monday, February 12, 2018 1:16 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Cc: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: 

Dear Jeffrey, 

Thank you for your email. This work is promised as the cover lot for The Exceptional Sale, taking place once a year, this 
April. 

0% all-inclusive - we would not charge any commission and all sale-related charges would be absorbed by Christie's. 

We will note in the final agreement: 

Estimate: $1.5-2.5m AGREED 
Reserve: $1m AGREED 

Thank you again for this lovely consignment. 

Best wishes, 

On Feb 12, 2018, at 8:04 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

ok to sell the hercules. with promised cover of exceptional low estimate of 1.5. reserve of 1 . commission? 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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Visit www.christies.com <http://www.christies.com> to explore special multi-media sale promotions, browse our 
illustrated catalogues and leave absentee bids through LotFinder(R), Christie's online search engine, and register for 
Internet bidding with Christie's Live(TM). 

This message and any attachment are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please telephone or email the 
sender and delete the message and any attachment from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you must 
not copy this message or attachment or disclose the contents to any other person. 
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