
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

deposit of 2 million 

Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Saturday, March 20, 2010 9:31 PM 

Re: S76 update 

On Sat, Mar 20, 2=10 at 4:16 PM, < > wrote: 

I just spoke to Reenstra, he said all is still a go at this time, we should=have a signed contract by tomorrow 
(Sunday) for Darren to review, he also =aid money is in place and should close next week. He didn't think ther= was 
going to be a deposit since we will go straight to closing early next=week, (that was his thoughts). 

Please advise if you require a deposit or another approach? 
Thank you, 
Larry 

Geor:es email address: 

Sent from my BlackBerry® wireless handheld 

  r.rr 
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