
From: Jeevacation <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, March 25, 2010 2:30 PM 
To: Poland, Marc B SIK 
Cc: George Reenstra 
Subject: Re: Emailing: SN 750 Purchase Agt.pdf 

We have waited a week for numbers , I am trying to work with you, the month end us your deadline and I would like to 
help 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 25, 2010, at 10:25 AM, "Poland, Marc B SIK' 
> wrote: 

> I will develop a summary of terms right now and provide within about 
> an hour. Subject to any comment or guidance following that, a full 
> contract should be able to be provided either late this afternoon or 
> early tomorrow. 

> Marc 

 Original Message 
> From: George Reenstra 
> Sent: Thursday, March 2 , : 
> To: Jeevacation 
> Cc: Poland, Marc B SIK 
> Subject: RE: Emailing: SN 750 Purchase Agt.pdf 

> Understand, I will forward to Marc. I think the problem is you can't 
> sign without a Sikorsky deal and will you sign a Sikorsky deal without 
> a firm deal on 750. Buyer for 750 will not proceed without executed 
> contract from you. I have passed this on to Marc for his thoughts as 
> to 
> how we solve this problem. As I have said yesterday I question if 
> the 
> buyer is real but the broker still has faith. 

> George Reenstra 
> Aircraft Services Group Inc 
> 300 Corporate Drive, Suite 2 
> Mahwah, NJ 07430 
> Tel (201) 995-9570 Ext. 118 
> Fax (201) 995-9504 
> g.reenstra@yourjet.com 

 Original Message 
> From: Jeevacation Imailtoieevacation@gmail.comj 
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> Sent: Thursday, March 25, 2010 9:58 AM 
> To: George Reenstra 
> Subject: Re: Emailing: SN 750 Purchase Agt.pdf 

> Can't do anything without a Sikorsky deal 

> Sent from my iPhoneh 

> On Mar 25, 2010, at 9:45 AM, "George Reenstra" 
> <g.reenstra@yourjet.com> wrote: 

» «SN 750 Purchase Agt.pdf» Section 2.0 should solve your commission 
» concern, both brokers have signed. I need your signature so we can 
» force this deal to a close or determine it's validity 

» George Reenstra 
» Aircraft Services Group Inc 
» 300 Corporate Drive, Suite 2 
» Mahwah, NJ 07430 
» Tel (201) 995-9570 Ext. 118 
» Fax (201) 995-9504 
» g.reenstra@yourjet.com 

» Original Message 
» From: Lois Klas 
» Sent: Thursday, March 25, 2010 9:38 AM 
» To: George Reenstra 
» Subject: Emailing: SN 750 Purchase Agt.pdf 
>> 

» The message is ready to be sent with the following file or link 
» attachments: 

» SN 750 Purchase Agt.pdf 

>> 

» Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may 
» prevent sending or receiving certain types of file attachments. 
» Check your e-mail security settings to determine how attachments are 
» handled. 
» <SN 750 Purchase Agt.pdf> 
<?xml version="1.0" encoding="UTF-8"?> 
<!DOCTYPE plist PUBLIC "-//Apple//DTD PLIST 1.0//EN" "http://www.apple.com/DTDs/PropertyList-1.O.dtd"> 
<plist version="1.0"> 
<dict> 

<key>conversation-id</key> 
<integer>160117</integer> 
<key>date-last-viewed<ikey> 
<integer>0</integer> 
<key>date-received</key> 
<integer>1269527403</integer> 
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<key>flags</key> 
<I nteger>8590195713</i nteger> 
<key>gmail-label-ids</key> 
<array> 

<integer>7</integer> 
</array> 
<key>remote-id</key> 
<string>73910</string> 

</diet> 
</plist> 
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