From: Richard Kahn < [

Sent: Thursday, February 8, 2018 6:18 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Russell

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: =/b>Re: LS)

Date: =/b>February 8, 2018 at 1:01:13 PM =5T

To: =/b=Richard Kah

Cc: Harvey Bloomst

Hi =ichard

The Day rate is ok if they are sending 3 mechanics the =uestion is do they need 3 days
We have sourced the wood flooring =aterial for the MBR, and specd waterproofing detail
We have sourced the palm =rees and the transport and a way to plant them

We have been reviewing =he clean up and maintenance Brice has been doing

We have been =nterviewing architects

I can list more stuff but this a quick =ummary
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| have =C'd Harvey that can update you on the payment
Thank you

Russell =ernandez

On Feb 8, =018, at 12:37 PM, Richard Kahn _

please confirm your received 35,000 i sent =his week

what have you been doing =egarding LSJ as i have not yet seen anything.

additionally quote below of 9848 seems a bit excessive to do =nspection on 2 generators
please =dvise

thank you

<EPG-18-519 =ittleStlames-inspection. pdf=

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
New =ork, NY 10022
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