From: Nicholas Ribis <[ -

Sent: Tuesday, June 26, 2018 2:21 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

Trying to get a advance
Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 26, 2018, at 10:14 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@=mail.com> > wrote:

Great , but we will deposit this week?

On Tue, Jun 26, 2018 at 3:58 PM Nicholas Ribis <[ G

<mailto:n=cholas.ribis@resortsintm.com> > wrote=

I'm sorry for delay in responding but | am at Doctor” for my fractured=shoulder we received ok from EU
formal meeting July 3 then it will close t=lk later

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 26, 2018, at 4:41 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@g=ail.com> >
wrote:

Press release? Good work
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