From: David Mitche!l [

Sent: Sunday, January 21, 2018 1:43 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: Fwd: Skyware / PCI Compliance

DAVID MITCHELL
Mitchell Holdings LLC
745 Fifth Avenue

New York NY 10151
USA

Begin forwarded message:

From: stephen Hanson

Date: January 20, 2018 at 2:27:20 PM EST
To: David Mitchell
Subject: Re: Skyware / PCl Compliance

So your 5 was new funds
The 5 from the restaurant is new 5.
It's all new $ that the hotel did not have

Sent from my iPad

wrote:
They want New funds
DAVID MITCHELL

Mitchell Holdings LLC
745 Fifth Avenue
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New York NY 10151
Usa

On Jan 20, 2018, at 1:41 PM, Stephen Hanson _

Why isn't all the money you advanced and the 32 k part of the 175
That doesn’t make sense at all

Sent from my iPad

On Jan 20, 2018, at 10:18 AM, David Mitche!l ||| |

It is both of our responsibilities as it is to secure $2,000,000 of in=erest reserve which
protect us on a personal level

As | told you | am putting together my half and already have advanced =oney for payroll,
Con Ed and retainer for Crescendo lawyer

The 532,000 was from the restaurant account to fund PR and Marketing a=d lessened
pressure in those areas
Cresendo wants to see new additional money , not money they have alrea=y funded

This new money is to fund operations as the Bank paid themselves the i=terest and left
the operational hole

DAVID MITCHELL
Mitchell Holdings LLC
745 Fifth Avenue

New York NY 10151
LU5A

On Jan 20, 2018, at 10:10 AM, shansongﬂa_
I, '~ rote:
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We just funded 32k why is this my responsibility. Your the=finance guy.

sent from my iPhone

On Jan 20, 2018, at 9:50 AM, David Mitchell _
I - o

This is why we need to fund the $175,000 Asap as this is what the hole=is

DAVID MITCHELL
Mitchell Holdings LLC
745 Fifth Avenue

New York NY 10151
LS8

On Jan 20, 2018, at 8:53 AM, Stephen Hanson _

MNo rush, On AP
How aggressive are they?.?

Sent from my iPad

_ On Jan 20, 2018, at 8:49 AM, Denise Luna _

wrote:

I am taking on all the calls when they come to me or when | hear the F= getting
velled at because the callers are going into voicemail.
Pallavi and | are managing all the calls ok for now.

| will send you an updated AP in a few min when | can get to a compute=.

Thank you

Denise Luna
General Manager
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Life Hotel
19 W 31st Street
Mew York, NY 10001

-———- Original message —-—

Date: 1/20/18 8:36 AM (GMT-05:00)

To: Geofirey Allan Mils

Alan Hochhauser , David Mitchell

Subject: Re: Skyware / PC| Compliance

Think you should take Pallavi off the pressure of these calls - no way=she signed
up for this - nor any of us but especially not she

Also we address her salary issues as | understand to be a problem ?&nb=p;

But still -can you send a accurate aging schedule so we see the extent=nbsp;

David when do you think this can be cleaned up - new loan ?

Sent from my iPad

On Jan 20, 2018, at 8:32 AM, Geoffrey Allan Mills _
I, - ot

Stephen we regularly go over this each week with Dav=d,

Denise, Pallavi and | are dealing with the collectio= calls, emails and notices.

Geoffrey Allan Mills
President & CEO=/span>
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The Graybar Buildin=
420 Lexington Avenu=

Suite 300-116, NY, =Y 10170
mobile: | N ofice: [ EEEGN
Email:— Web: http://gamhospitality.com

&nbs=; “We are yours in Hospitality”

<http:=/gamhospitality.com/>

Sent: Saturday, January 20, 2018 8:30 AM

Cc: Geoffrey Allan Mills
I o Hochhauser David Mitchell
Pallavi Padole _

Subject: Re: Skyware / PC| Compliance

Denise

Understand

Can we all see a AP aging schedule

Let’s all understand the severity of our AP <=p>
And who's taking al= these collection calls ?

Sent from my iPad

On Jan 20, 2018, at 8:22 AM, Denise Luna _

Steve not sure but there are alot of vendors that have not been paid t=at are
now having collection agencies reaching out to us.

We really need to manage our existing vendors for our daily hotel need= to be
able to continue to run a hotel. We also have to be able to h=ve money for payroll as well.

§
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We have alot of vendors that are ACH and they immediately take their m=ney
out of our account.

I know this is very important and we need this to be in compliance but=right
now this needs to be put on hold until we can have the funds.=/p>

Thank=you

Denis= Luna

Gener=| Manager

Life =otel

19 W =1st Street

New Y=rk, N¥ 10001
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-------- Original message --------

_ — _

Date: 1/20/18 8:12 AM (GMT-05:00)

To: Geoffrey Allan il |

Denise Luna
Pallavi Padol

David Mitchell

Subject: Re: Skyware / PC| Compliance

S0 how do we purchase=these iterms?

Sent from my iPad

On Jan 18, 2018, at 11:09 AM, Geoffrey Allan Mills _

Sorry Alan,

Yes this is an important PCl issue. | agree we=should purchase 3 of these
devices when possible,

Thanks

Geoffrey Allan Mills

President & CEQ

GAM Hospitality Management LLC.
The Graybar Building

420 Lexington Avenue

Suite 300-116, NY,=NY 10170
Mobile: [
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Web: htt=://gamhospitality.com <http://gamhospitality.com/>

&nbs=; “We are yours in Hospitality”

On Jan 18, 2018, at 10:40 AM, Alan Hochhauser _

I

Any update on this? 1=92m meeting Sorbis tomorrow to try to wrap up some
issues and push for bet=er support

Alan Hochhauser

Chief Financial Officer

Henry At Life Hotel
19 West 31st 5t

NY NY 10001

lifehotel.com <http://www.lifehotel.com/> =/p>
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From: Denise Luna
Sent: Monday, January 15, 2018 12:41 PM

To: Alan Hochhauser
David Mitchell ; Stephen Hanson
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Ce: Pallavi Padole [
Geoffrey Allan il

Subject: FW: Skyware / PCI Compliance

Thank you Alan,

| will follow up with Geoffrey and David

Thanks,

Denise Luna

General Manager
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PPlease consider the environment before printing

From: Alan Hochhauser
Sent: Monday, January 15, 2018 12:36 PM

I, s Luno
Subject: Skyware ompliance

The PCI assessment identified a vulnerability point =ecause credit card
information entered at the property level into Skyware =s done from a keyboard which is non-encrypted & vulnerable to
being ha=sked.

Attached are the for the recommended device to gain =ompliance, it looks like
the cost on them is about 5175 each. My suggestio= is 3 devices — front desk, GM office and accounting office.

Please let me know how you'd like to proceed and |=will work with Sorbis to
source and install.

Alan Hochhauser

Chief Financial Officer

Henry At Life Hotel
19 West 31st 5t

NY NY 10001
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