
From: paul krassner 
Sent: Wednesday, January 17, 2018 11:54 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: question 

On Jan 17, 2018, at 1:56 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

It was to end in dec. but NIchrck 

My anxiety just did so. 

The contract states that I would =eceive $25,000 in 2017. But I received $20,000. 

Also, - The term of this =greement shall commence on February 1, 2017 and shall expire on January =1, 2018" 
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