From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, January 15, 2018 12:30 PM
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: 2018 Suburban Premier.

les concern with numbers |, for all . Isj=gs pb. timing is more important. thax
<=div>

On Mon, Jan =5, 2018 at 7:16 AM, Richard Kahn <richardkahnl2@gmail.com <mailto:r=chardkahnl2@gmail.com>
></=pan> wrote:

I will=follow up on timing and getting closer to 21 net.

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates =nc.
575 Lexingt=n Avenue, 4th Floor

<https://maps.google.com/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue=+4th+FloorNew+York,+NY+10022&entry=gmail&source=g>
New York, NY 10022
<https://maps.google.com/?q==75+Lexington+Avenue,+4th+FloorNew+York,+NY+10022&entry=gmail&sou=ce=g>
Tel 212-971-1306 <tel:{212)%620=71-1306>
Fax 646-350-0954 <tel:(646)%20350-0954>
Cell 917-414-7584 <tel:(917)%20414-7584>

B=gin forwarded message:

From= Greg Melito <greg.melito@gmail.com <mailto:greg.melito@gmail.com> >
Date: January 14, 2018 at 12:=2:34 PM E5T

To: Richard Kahn <richardkahnl2@gmail.com <mailto:richardkahn12=gmail.com> >
Subject= 2018 Suburban Premier.

After | ran everything | got $22,869.70 =ll in. Working on the logistics with the trucks. Let me know what
you are =hinking. Have a great weekend

Greg

<=iv dir="Itr">  please note
<=iv>The information contained in this communication is confidential, may=be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and i= intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of J=E Unauthorized use,

1

EFTA_R1_01685944
EFTA02538362



disclosure or copying of this communication or a=y part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
=eceived this communication in error, please notify us immediately by jeevacation@gmail.com

<mailto:;jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication=and all copies thereof, including all attachments.
copyright -all right= reserved
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