From: Richard kahn -

Sent: Wednesday, January 17, 2018 2:11 AM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

Yes bonus 1/4/2018. Let me guess he did not=even say thank you...

Richard KahnHBRK Associates Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
M=w York, NY 10022

Tel

Fax
Cell

On Jan 16, 2018, at 8:43 P=, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail=com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

Did we pay Dave and bonus

please note

The infor=ation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-c=ient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only=for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof i= strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
c=mmunication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or b= e-mail to jeeva=ation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and
destroy this communication and all copies there=f,
including all attachments, copyright -all rights reserved

</=iv>
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