
From: Ann Rodriquez < 
Sent: Thursday, January 4, 2018 5:13 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: WAPA Update 

yes, Friday & Saturday (2 days) Today was a wasted day because the Manhole still had water in it even tho=gh Danny 
said it didn't. It's being pumped out again as we s=eak 

WAPA & Liston can't do anything ar=und water or in water 

Ann R. 

On Jan 4, 2018, at 12:51 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacat=on@gmail.com» wrote: 

what about tomorw? 

On Thu, Jan 4, 2018 at 11:46 AM= Ann Rodriquez < 
<mailto > wrote: 

Bryan's electric guys confi=med 2 days of Splicing & getting the new Manhole in. If the same crew t=at worked 
today come back out on Saturday we "might" be abl= to have WAPA on Monday 

cimage2.jpeg><image7.jpeg>cimage8.jpeg><image10.jpeg> 

Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message:<=r> 

<mailto 

From: Hugo Hodge < 
Date: January 4, 2018 at 10:27:27 AM AST 
To: <mailto 

<mailto 

Subject: 

Goothmorning All, 

> , Ann Rodriquez 

We have started the work on L=J. From my initial estimate, it will take 2 full days to get the cable 
sp=iced with the new manhole in place. Once that takes place tomorrow we will t=en test the cable (Hi-Pot test) and 
then leave the cable energized for at l=ast 24 hours. After that period, we will then go through the steps to put VI back 
on WAPA's Grid. 
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HH4=iv> 

please note 
=div>The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may=be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is=intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE=br>Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any p=rt thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have recei=ed this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
recur= e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all=copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserve= 
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