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Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Matthew Mazotas 

Subject: ./b>RE: Estimated Tax =ayment Voucher Needed 

Date: =/b>December 18, 2017 at 11:40:29 =M EST 

To: =/b>Deborah Pechet Quinan 
"Richard Kahn ( 1)" < 

Cc: "Noam Chomsk 
"Valeria Chomsk "Nick Nichols" < 
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Hi All, 

Max, attached please find the requested 2017 Q4 Federal =stimated Tax Voucher for the Chomksy's. 

Please be =ware that in raising cash to make this payment from the trust, it may =reate income that might be taxed to 
Noam due to the trust =istribution. 

A state estimated tax payment should be made in 2017 to take =dvantage of the deduction for state tax payments. This 
deduction will =e severely limited if the new tax bill is enacted. Please advise on an =mount that the Chomsky's would 
like to pay in order to take =dvantage of this deduction. We had recommended $30,000 when we prepared =heir 2016 
return, based on safe harbor amounts. 

Regards, 

Matthew Mazotas 
Supervisor 

ALL =PAs 
Tax =E244 Accounting — Advisory 
1330=Boylston Street Suite 510 
Chestnut Hill. MA 02467 

Web: www.all-cpas.com 

Member of MSI Global Alliance: www.msiglobal.org 

Click =ere to upload =iles securely. 
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