From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Monday, December 18, 2017 5:07 PM

To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Fwd: Estimated Tax Payment Voucher Needed
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00384.htm; image003.png; Untitled attachment 00387.htm; image004.png; Untitled
attachment 00390.htm; image005.png; Untitled attachment 00393.htm; Untitled
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Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:
From: =/b>Deborah Pechet Quinan _
Subject: =/b>FW: Estimated Tax =ayment Voucher Needed

Date: =/b>December 18, 2017 at 11:47:17 =M EST

To:=/b>*Richard ko (- I
Cc: "Noam Chomsky "=t mailta_ >,

Richard,
Please see below the Massachusetts =stimated tax question and advise.
Thank you,

Deborah
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Deborah Pechet Quinan, Esg. LL.M,
Shareholder
Chair, =rusts & Estates Group

Boston, MA =2109
=Direct: | CEII:_

Assistant - Jayne Mahoney
Office: | Fax:
e-mail: dpg@riw.com | www.riw.com | BIO
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