
From: Ann Rodriquez 
Sent: Thursday, December 14, 2017 9:26 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: Anna's house 

thank you so much 

Ann R. 

On Dec 14, 2017, at 5:16 PM, jeffrey=E. sieevacation@gmailcom <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> &g=; wrote: 

n nee= to pay it back of course 

On Thu, Dec 14, 2017 at 4:09 PM, Ann Rodriquez 
<mailto > wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

Can the STC office write a check on my behalf for Big Lorn Sewage ($1,125.00= and Gems Sewage 
($350.00) in the amount of $1,475.00? 

I promise I'll pay it back. Every time we have Heavy rain and floodi=g my sewage overflows into the 
street and the Sewage trucks have to come ou=. I've called them about 8 times since Hurricane Irma and Maria. 

I don't have any money at the moment. I've been paying my si=ter biweekly to keep on the 
weekends, I've been takin= care of my mom and buying little things for my house with my STC paycheck.=I'm so sorry to 
have to ask you for something like this 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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&=bsp; please note 

The information cont=ined in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privi=eged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the=use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, dis=losure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly p=ohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication=in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to <= href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com" 

target="_blank">jeevacation@gmail.=om, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
includ=ng all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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