
From: Ann Rodriquez < 
Sent: Friday, December 15, 2017 8:32 AM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

I really appreciate it. Thank you once agai= 

Ann R. 

On Dec 14= 2017, at 6:04 PM, jeffrey E. <=eevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

=div> 
we pay for ALL work done to bring ana house back=to perfect thx 

&n=sp; please note 

The information contained i= this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, m=y 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of t=e addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure o= copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibite= 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in erro=, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, a=d 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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