From: Eileen McDowell _

Sent: Wednesday, December 13, 2017 11:20 AM
To: jeffrey E,; Eric Roth

Subject: Re: G550 - Fabric seats

Thank you Jeffrey

EILEEN MCDOWELL | INTERIOR DESIGN
INTERMATIONAL JET INTERIORS

£31.737.5900 <tel:631.737.5900> | www.intljet.com <http://www.intljet.com/>

On Dec 13, 2017, at 6:15 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

arm yes, seatno

wrote:

Hi leffrey,

Would you like us to copy the same stitch detail on the back cushion and bottom cushion? See pictures
attached.

We can also do a top stitch on the arm [picture attached) or just a seam.
Please confirm.
Thank you!
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INTERMATIONAL JET INTERIORS

631.737.5900 <tel:631.737.5900> | www.intljet.com <http://www.intljet.com/>

please note

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com=, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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