From: Richard kahn |

Sent: Wednesday, December 6, 2017 7:26 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: Fwd: 2016 tax payments

==iv style="direction: inherit;">Richard Kahn HBRK Associates Inc.

=, "Noam Chomsky |
, "Waleria Chomsky

Subject: =E: 2016 tax payments

=blockquote type="cite">

Thank you Matthew.=/o:p>

Best,=/p>

Deborah

Deborah Pechet Quin=n, Esq. LL.M. =br> Shareholder
Chair, Trusts & Es=ates Group
255 State Street, 7th Floor | Boston= MA 02109

Assistant - layne Mahone
Office :

e-mail | www.riw.coms/=> <http://www.riw.com/> | BIO
<http://www.riw.com/=ttorney/deborah-pechet-quinan/>

From: Matthew Maz=tas [

Sent: Wednesday, December 06, 2017 9:18 AM
To: Deborah Pechet Quinan; Nick Michols

Ce: Richard Kahn (S
Noam Chomnsky (Y ' cria Chomsky
]

Subject: RE: 2016 tax payments
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Hi Deborah,

Below is the 2016 information you requested.

Federal:

Q2 Estimate- 543,000- Amount was distributed from IRA=on 6/15/16 to make payment.

Q4 Estimate in Jan- $60,000- Amount was distributed f=om IRA around 1/5/17 to make payment.
Extension Payment- 5175,000- Electronically withdrawn=from BoA around 4/18/17.

2015 Overpayment Applied to 2016 Tax- 574,059

2016 Estimated Tax Penalty- 5204 (reduced the 2016 ca=ryforward)

Massachusetts:

Q2 Estimate- $6,000- Amount was distributed from IRA o= 6/15/16 to make payment.
Q4 Estimate- 512,000- Paid in December 2016 by Valeri= from Bank of America account.
Extension Payment- $25,000- Electronically withdrawn f=om BoA around 4/18/17.

2015 Overpayment Applied to 2016 Tax- 542,411

2016 Underpayment of Estimated Tax Penalty- 567 (redu=ed the 2016 carryforward)

If you have any questions, please let me know.</=:p>

Regards,

Matthew Mazotas

Supervisor=/p>
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Abrams Little-Gill Loberfeld PC<=b>
CPAs & Business Advisors

1330 Boylston Street Suite 510
Chestnut Hill, MA 02467

Tel.

Fax:

ermai I

Web: www.all-cpas.com <http://www.all-cpas.com/>

Member of MSI Global Alliance: www.msiglobal.org <http://www.msiglobal.org/>
Click here <https://all-cpas.sharefile.com/r=rc078fccfed745c9a> to upload files securely.

<https://www.facebook.com/allcpas>  <https://www.instagram.com/allcpa=/>

: Valeria
Chomsky
_Matthew Mazotas 4

Subject: 2016 tax payments

Dear Mick, -

Could you or Matthew please send me all amounts and d=tes of tax payments and penalties that Noam made for the
2016 tax year for b=th fed and MA purposes at your very earliest convenience.

Thanks,
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Deborah

Deborah Pechet Quin=n, Esq. LL.M. =br> Shareholder
Chair, Trusts & Es=ates Group
255 State Street, 7th Floor | Boston= MA 02109

Assistant - Jayne Mahoney:
Officell N | -

e-mail :_ &n=sp;| www.riw.com
<https://url=efense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=http-

38 www.riw.com_&d=DwMFAgRc=3DeuGZstcaTDIlvimENSb7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpenViiiMMEir=k9W0E653-
ABzX1lesMolZOM=p3_nYPEVjkYgttHVARs00&m=73NAzdcYAL3GpR_rLRQzflpTP9707IEPegM50N20srd Ea=p;s=0foCliDAM
qGODRXV7e67CElswIFm2slaE2C5G6qIARQ&e=> =nbsp; | BIO <https://urldefe=se. proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=http-

3A_ www.riw.com_attorney_deborah-2Dpechet=2Dquinan_&d=DwMFAg&c=euGZstcaTDIWimENEb7jXrwgOf-
v5A_CdpgnVfiiM=&r=k9W0653-
AbzX1lesMolZOMEp3_nYPEVjkYgttHVARSO0&mM=73NAzdcYAL3GpR=rLRQzflpTP9707IEPegM50N20sr4&s=BwM7aoDlg24
eR3uBsSHmMKtPwGtAadOUNYHrkFy=5]_A&e=> =br>

MNOTICE: This email with its attachments, if any, is i=tended solely for permitted use by authorized recipients. If you are
not an=authorized recipient of this email, your retention, transmission, disclosur=, or use of this email is prohibited. If

you received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete th=s email and its attachments from your devices

and systems.

NOTICE: This email with its attachments, if any, is intended solely for perm=tted use by authorized recipients. If you are
not an authorized recipient o= this email, your retention, transmission, disclosure, or use of this email=is prohibited. If
you received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete this email and its=attachments from your devices
and systems.
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