From:

Sent: Saturday, April 21, 2012 12:46 PM
To: Jeffrey
Subject: Re: Fwd:

Split up between new amsterdam investments (75% imad, 25% frank) and another=partner called Boost.
Then minus all the expenses they had.

Frank also got money on his account after the deal, but never transferred it=to me even though in that separate contract
it says he has to as he owns 25=

Sent from my iPhone
On Apr 21, 2012, at 3:49, Jeffrey <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

> That agreement can set aside the settlement. It is a part of it . Where i= the 175k from elite
=

= Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone

>
=0n Apr 20, 2012, at 8:37 PM, _mte:

-1

=> Theres another agreement between imads company 'new amsterdam investment'=and mine, regarding Elite
>3

>> Thats the one that will get translated this weekend
=

== Thanks for your help
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»> <Settlement Agreement.pdf>
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