
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Thursday, December 7, 2017 4:25 PM 
To: jeffre E. 
Subject: Re: 

ok 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
te 
fax 
cell 

On Dec 7, 2017, at 11:24 AM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

send her 6k 

On Thu, Dec 7, 2017 at 11:23 AM, =ichard Kahn < > wrote: 

a reminder that for =chool invoice unless you prefer bella or myself to reach out to= 

merwin is coming at 2:30pm to pickup your iPad mini and Euros 

shall i also have merwin pick up $2500 for= or should i coordinate =irectly with her 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
te <tel:212-971-1306> 
fax <tel:212-320-0381> 
cell tel:917.414-7584> 

EFTA_R1_01710662 
EFTA02553597



please note 

The information contained in this =ommunication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this 
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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