
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, December 7, 2017 5:10 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: 2016 tax payments 

deborah, i have asked for 2017 estimates =you asked for 2016,  please do so immediatly 
<=div> 

On Thu, Dec =, 2017 at 12:08 PM, Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com <mailto:r=chardkahn12@gmail.com> 
></=pan> wrote: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington 

<https://maps.google=com/?q=575+LexingtonVoCrY0A0Avenue+4th+Floor+New+York,+NY%C2%A010022&e=try=gmail& 
source=g> Avenue 4th Floor 
<https://maps=google.com/?q=575+LexingtonVoC2P0A0Avenue÷4th+Floor+New+York,+NY%C2e/cA01002=&entry=gmail& 
source=g> 

New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971=1306 
fax 212-320-0381 <tel:(212)%20320-0381> 
cell 917-414.7584 <tel:(917)%20414.7584> 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Deborah Pechet Quinan <=a href="mailto:dq@riw.com" target="_blank">dq@riw.com> 

Subject: Cc: "Noam Chomsky 

Richard, 

Please review the emails from Nick and me over the la=t couple of days re 2017 estimates. 

Please respond to the email I sent you yesterday at 1:56 p.m.=u> 
CU> 
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Perhaps we should speak in o=der clear this up. I can proceed to email Max when I have the guidan=e I 
need from you and then confirmation from Noam. 

Please let me know a convenient time to speak this a=ternoon after 2:00 p.m. and I will proceed to email 
Max from that call.=/u> 

=/span> 
Deborah 

Deborah Pechet Quinan, Esq. LL.M= 
Shareholder 
Chair, Trus=s & Estates Group 
255 State Street, 7th Floor 

<https://maps.google.com/?q=255+Sta=e+Street,+7th+Floor%C2%A0%7C%C2%A0Boston,+MA+02109&entry=gmail&s= 
urce=g> I Boston, MA 02109 =span style="font-size:11pt;font-family:Calibri,sans-serif;color:rgb(31,7=,125)"> 

Direct: 617.570.3521 <tel:(617)%20570-3521> I Cell: 617.832.=726 
Assistant - Jayne Mahoney: 617.570.3581 <tel:=617)%20570-3581> =C2* 
Office: 617.742.4200 <tel:(617)%20742.4200> I <=pan style="font-size:11pt;font-family:Calibri,sans-

seriecolor:rgb(31,73.125)"> Fax: 617.742.2355 <tel:(617)%20742.2355> 
e-mail:Q=A0dpq@riw.com <mailto:dpq@riw.com> I www. <http://www.riw.com/> I BIO =span 

style="font-size:11pt;font-family:Calibri,sans-serif;color:rgb(31,7=,125)"> 

=/u> 
From: Richard Kahn (mailto:ric=ardkahn12@gmail.com <mailto:richardkahn12@gmail.com> ] 
Sent: Thursday, December 07, 2017 10:38=AM 
To: Deborah Pechet Quinan 
Subject: Re: 2016 tax payments<=> 

what is the estimate for 2017?=/u> 
you should demand both years 
as i said yesterday, 150= will be used as a credit if too much... 
every day goes by and so far no results at all...=C2* 
<=div> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates =nc. 
575 Lexi=gton 

<https://maps.google.com/?q=575+Lexington%C2%A0Avenue+4=h+Floor+New+York,+NY%C2%A010022&entry=gmail& 
source=g> A=enue 4th Floor 
chttps://maps.google.com/?q=575+Lexington%C2%A0A=enue+4th+Floor+New+York,+NY%C2%A010022&entry=gmail&s 
ource=g> 

New York, NY 
<https://maps.google.com/?q=575+Lexingto=%C2%A0Avenue+4th+Floor+New+York,+NY%C2%A010022&entry=gmail&s 
ourc==g> 10022 
<https://maps.google.com/?q=575+Lerington%C2%A0Avenue+4th+Floor+New+York,+NY%C2cYcA010022&entry=gmail& 
=source=g> 

tel 212-971-1306 <tel:(212)%20971.1306> 
fax 212-320-0381 <tel:(212)%2=320-0381> 
cel= <tel:(917)%20414-7584> 
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On Dec 6, 2017, at 2:03 PM,=Deborah Pechet Quinan cdq@riw.com <mailto:dq@riw.com» 
wrote:<=> 

<=iv> 
Thank you Matthew.</=iv> 

</=iv> 
Best, 
Deborah 

 =4>=A0 
Deborah Pechet Quinan, Esq. =L.M. 
Shareholder=/span> 
Chair, Trusts & =states Group 
255 State Street, 7th Floor 

<https://maps.google.comfiq=255+5=ate+Street,+7th+Floor%C2%A0%7O/42%A0Boston,+MA+02109&entry=gmail&=s 
ource=g> I 
chttps://maps.google.com/?q=255+State+Street,+7th+=loor%C2V0A0%7C%C2%A0Boston,+MA+02109&entry=gmail&so 
urce=g> Bos=on, MA 02109 
<https://maps.google.com/?q=255+State+Street,+7th=Floor%C2%A0%7C%C2%A0Boston,+MA+02109&entry=gmail&so 
urce=g> 

Direct: 617.570.3521 <tel:(617)%2057=-3521> I Cell: 617.832.5726 <tel:(617)%20832-5726> 
Assistant - =ayne Mahoney: 617.570.3581 <tel:(617)%20570.3581> 
Office: www.riw.com <tel:(617)%20742.4200= value=> I WO 

<http://www.riw.com/attorney/deborah-pechet-quinan/> 

utjec : r • 
<=iv> 

ax paymen s 

Hi Debo=ah, 

Below is the 2016 information you requested.=u> 
=/div> 
Federal: 
Q2 Estimate- $43,000- Amount was distributed from IRA on 6/15/16 to=make payment. 
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=span style="font-size:11pt;font-family:Calibri,sans-serir>Q4 Estimate i= Jan- $60,000- Amount 
was distributed from IRA around 1/5/17 to make payme=t. 

Extension Payment- $175,=00- Electronically withdrawn from BoA around 4/18/17.=/div> 
2015 Overpayment Applied to 2016 Tax- $74,059=/u> 
2016 Estimated Tax Penalty- $2=4 (reduced the 2016 carryforward) 

<=pan style="font-size:11ptfont-family:Calibri,sans-serif">Massachusetts:=u> 
Q2 Estimate- $6,000- Amount=was distributed from IRA on 6/15/16 to make payment.<=div> 
Q4 Estimate- $12,000- Paid in December 2016 by Va=eria from Bank of America account. 
Extension Payment- $25,000- Electronically withdrawn from BoA aroun= 4/18/17. 
2015 Overpayment =pplied to 2016 Tax- $42,411 

</=pan> 
If you have any questions, please let me kn=w. 

Regards, 

=span style="font-size:11ptfont-family:Arial,sans-serir>Matthew Mazotas=/span> 
Supervisor 

Abrams Little-Gill Loberfeld =C 
CPAs & Business Advisors 
1330 Boylston Str=et Suite 510 

chttps://maps.google.com/?q=1330+Boylston+Street+Suite+510=hestnut+Hill,+MA+02467&entry=gmail&source=g> 
Chestnut Hill, MA 02467 

<https:/=maps.google.comPq=1330+Boylston+Street+Suite+510Chestnut+Hill,+MA+02467=amp;entry=gmail&sourcerg 

Tel.: 617-738-5200 Ext. 225 <tel:(617)%20738-5200> 
Fax: 617-738-0875 <tel:(617)%20738-0875> 
<=iv style="margin:0in 0in 0.0001ptfont-size:12ptfont-familylimes =ew 

Romani,serif">Email:=C2*=mazotas@all-cpas.com <mailto:mmazotas@all-cpas.com> 
We=: =a href="http://www.all-cpas.com/" style="color:purple;text-decoration:=nderline" 

target="_blank">www.all-cpas.com<=span> 
</=iv> 
Member of MSI Global Alliance: www.msiglobal.org <http:=/www.msiglobal.org/> =/u> 

=div> 
Click here <https://all-cpas.sharefile.com/r-rc078fccfed745c9a> to upload files 

securely.<=span> 

cimage00..png> <https://www.facebook.com/allcpas> =a href="https://twitter.com/allcpas" 
style="color:purple;text-decorati=n:underline" target="_blank"><image004.png>=/span> <image005.png> 
<image006.png> <https://www.instagram.com/allcpas/> 

<image007.png> <https://goo.gl/BuLtKV> </=> 

From:Q=A0Deborah Pechet Quinan [mailto:dq@riw.com <mailto:dq@riw.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, December 5, 2017 5:50 =M 
To:Nick Nichols <NickN@all-cpas.com <mailto:NickN@all-cpas.com» 
Cc: Richard Kahn=(richardka=n12@gmail.com <mailto:richardkahn12@gmail.com> ) 

<richardkahn12@gmail.com <mailto:richardkahn12@gmail.com»; Noam Chomsky (<= 
href="mailto:nchomsky3@gmail.com" style="color:purple;text-decoration=underline" 
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target="_blank">nchomsky3@gmail.=om) <nchomsky3@gmail.com <mailto:nchomsky3@gmail.com»; Valeria 
Chomsky (valeria.chomsky@gmail.com<=span>) <valeria.chomsky@gmail.com <mailto:valeria.chomsky@gmail.com»; 
Matthew Mazotas <MMazotas@all-cpas.c=m> 

Subject: 2016 tax payments 

=div> 
Dear Nick, 
=C240 
Could you or Matthew =lease send me all amounts and dates of tax payments and penalties that 

Noa= made for the 2016 tax year for both fed and MA purposes at your very earl=est convenience. 
<=u> 
Thanks, 
Deborah 

Boston, MA 021094,=A0 
617.570.3521 <tel:(617)%20570-3521> I Cell: 617.832.5726 <tel:(61=)%20832-5726> 40=A0 
617.570.3581 <tel:(617)%20570-3581> 
Office: 617.742.4200 <tel:(61=)%20742-4200> I Fax: 617.742-2355 <tel:(617)%2074=-2355> 
e-mail: dpq@riw.com =C2* I www.riw.com I BIO 

<https://urldefense.proofpoint.com=v2/url?u=http-3A_www.riw.com_attorney_deborah-2Dpechet-
2Dquinan_&d=3DDwMFAg&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=k9W06=3-
A6zXlesMoIZOMEp3_nYP6VjkYgttHV4Rs00&m=73NAzdcYAL3GpR_rLRQzflpTP970=IEPeqM5ON2osr4&s=8wM7aoDlq24 
eR3uBsSHmKtPwGtAadOUNYHrkFyQ5J_A&e=3D> 

<image002.gif> 

NOTICE: This email with i=s attachments, if any, is intended solely for permitted use by 
authorized =ecipients. If you are not an authorized recipient of this email, your rete=tion, transmission, disclosure, or 
use of this email is prohibited. If you=received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete this ema=l and its 
attachments from your devices and systems.<=div> 

</=iv> 
NOTICE: This email wit= its attachments, if any, is intended solely for permitted use by 

authoriz=d recipients. If you are not an authorized recipient of this email, your r=tention, transmission, disclosure, or use 
of this email is prohibited. If =ou received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete this =mail and its 
attachments from your devices and systems. 

class="gmail_signature" data-smartmail="gmail_signature"> 
please note 

The=information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be att=rney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is inten=ed only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
U=authorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
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communication or any part=thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have receive= this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return=e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and 
destroy this communication and al= copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reser=ed 
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