
From: Karen Chien 
Sent: Thursday, November 30, 2017 9:21 PM 
To: Peggy Siegal 
Cc: Joshua Schmell; jeevacation@gmail.com 
Subject: Re: 318 Technology Question 

No, our statements do not include contracts/work provided =y 318 technology. They were paid directly by you. 

You can clarify this with Homero Perez. 

Karen Chien, As=ociate ASID 
Principal 

Karen Chien, In=orporated 
70 Washington Street, #6K 

=div> 

KP Design Build LLC 
Interior Desi=n I Construction Punch List Services 
70 Washington Street, #6K 
Brook=yn, NY 11201 

On Thu, Nov 30, 2017 at 4:06 PM, Peggy Siega= <P wrote: 

I just got off the phone with Homero Perez from 318 =ech. 

Do your statements include the bills from 318 Techno=ogy? 

I have 1 bill for $2,170.97 and another bill for $14=696.04. 
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Are these bills included in yours statements or are =hey to be paid separately? 
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