
From: Peggy Siegal 
Sent: Thursday, November 30, 2017 10:24 PM 
To: Karen Chien 
Cc: Joshua Schmell; jeevacation@gmail.com; Rebecca Drescher 
Subject: Re: 318 Technology Question 

We will pay Homero directly asap. 
Thank you. Peggy 
= = 
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From: Karen Chien 
Thursday, November 30, 2017 4:22 PM 
To: Peggy S=egal 
Cc: Joshua Schmell; jeevacation@gmail.com 
=b>Subject: Re: 318 Technology Question 
</=able> 

No, our statements do not include contracts=work provided by 318 technology. They were paid directly by you. 

They gave us a wiring plan and provided the wire/materials =e needed to have our electrician install the wiring according 
to the plan.=nbsp; When we are in the final phase, they will provide the switches for u= to install. They are also 
providing the materials & programming=for the Lutron Radio RA System and motorized shades. They do =ot provide 
electrical wiring work. They have been to the site perio=ically to ensure that the wire installation work meets their 
expectation.<=div> 

You can clarify this with Homero Perez. 

<=iv> 

Karen=Chien, Associate ASID 
Principal 

Karen=Chien, Incorporated 
70 Washington Street, #6K 
Broo=lyn, NY 11201 
tel and fax (718) 230-5777 

KP Design Build LLC 
Int=rior Design I Construction Punch List Services 
70 Washington Street, #6K 
Brooklyn, NY 11201 
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tel and fax&nb=p;(718) 230.5777 <tel:(718)%20230-5777 
=div> 

</=iv> 

On Thu, Nov 30, 2017 at 4:06 PM, Peggy Siega= > wrote: 
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