
From: Joshua Schmell 
Sent: Friday, December 1, 2017 9:42 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: Peggy 

Just left her a message. 

On Dec 1, 2017, at 4:36 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

now ok if you like 

On Fri, Dec 1, 2017 at 4:35 PM, Joshua Schmell 

Agreed, can we talk Monday? 

wrote: 

On Dec 1, 2017, at 4:31 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 
wrote: 

the altenaive josh is to pay her so she continus and then move to court to uncover details . 
pain in the neck but an option, not sure what she meant about her insurance etc. 

On Fri, Dec 1, 2017 at 4:27 PM, Joshua Schmell 
wrote: 

Karen - I just saw your email, we're not looking to not pay you. Both Jeffrey and I have 
reviewed your contract. We both don't see were it is that you don't have to show vendor bills. 

We want to move forward but need to know what the actual bills are? I think this is a 
more than fair request. I've worked with other contractors and I've never had this issue. 

forward with getting it done. 
We've all invested a lot of time and energy on this project and just want to move 

Thanks. 
Josh 
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please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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