From: Richard Kahn |

Sent: Tuesday, November 28, 2017 10:40 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: Nautilus Print

please advise which entity should send the money thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fax

cel

On Mov 28, 2017, at 10:59 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

as lisais myidol, iwill =und the 25 k

On Tue, Nov 28, 2017 at 10:06 AM, =ohn Steele ||| EGNNNEE ot

Jeffrey,

I'm =eaching out to our most influential and supportive readers to help us =et the next issue of the
Nautilus print edition out the door. =e're trying to raise $25,000 to cover the printing and shipping =osts for Issue 22.
Jeffrey, | think you know better than most =oth the appeal of what Nautilus brings to the world and the challenges
=urrounding the effort. We're making a lot of headway on a =ossible merger or acquisition but are obviously going
through a few =ean months. But the most important aspect to Nautilus' =urvival is to provide our loyal subscribers with
their magazines. =hich is why we're making this appeal. | do hope you can =ee your way clear to making an end of year,
tax-deductible donation to =he cause. You can contribute via credit =ard or check to the address below.

| appreciate your =onsideration and the time you've taken to help =autilus.

All =he best,
John

EFTA_R1_01720608
EFTA02559902



John Steele
Publisher & Editorial =irector
Mautilus

www.nautil.us <http://www.nautil.us/>

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =sttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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