
From: 
Sent: Tuesday, November 28, 2017 6:46 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

I cannot repay her. I don't think she should pay=for me and I don't understand why has to help me financially 
an= not you.. 

II giorno Tue, Nov 28,=2017 alle 6:21 PM jeffrey E. <=eevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» ha 
scritto: 

Take it 

On Tue, Nov 28, 2017 at 1:09 PM > wrote: 

Jeffrey, was very kind and told me that if I needed help she co=Id give me 2k for this month. I'm 
not sure if I should accept because = cannot promise to give her the money back and the situation that she has =o pay 
for me makes me a bit uncomfortable... 

4,=ACI please note 

The information=contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client=privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for=br>the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized =se, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
co=munication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or I= e-mail to jeev=cation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies the=eof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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