From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com=>

Sent: Friday, November 30, 2012 5:19 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Cc: . Jean Luc Brunel

Subject: Re:

Whatever he wants

On Friday, November 30, 2012, Rich=rd Kahn wrote:
attached is correspondence from JL and Domingque along with model state=ent
the balance on statement shows you owe MC2 6,645.48

JL said 5,000 commission should be returned
please advise on ho= to proceed

==>To: D=minique Nameche <dominique @mc2mm.com <javascript:_e{{}, 'cvml’,

<=>5ubject: Re: RE: Fwd: RE:

No commission on - | don't mind to forget test and apt.=But not working visa that we have processed
and we were never reimbursed=A0

From: D=minigue Nameche

Sent: Thursday, November 29, 2012 05:44 PM
To: Jlean Luc Brunel

Subject: FW: RE: Fwd: RE:

</=ont>

=A0
Hi Richard,

You are right, but in the meantime Selana owes us some money and got a nega=ive balance on her statement
for the following : Visa processing fee, Test=with photographer, Website fee, courrier, comcards, appt rent.</=>

<=div>

I will have the 20% fee reverse to her account and will have that amo=nt applied the negative balance owes to
MC2 and if any balance due to S=lana, | will have a check cut to her.
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regards

Dominique.

=br>

Ji!it!.*i#t*!**..m‘ii**lli'#ilﬁlﬂii*!..#i***.*!.**!i!ﬂi-t!.**it*!¢t<=r}'l'he ir‘lft‘.‘lrr'l'latl'ﬂr'l tﬂntainEd in thls
communication is confidential, may =e attorney-client privileged, may constitute inside information, and is intended
only for the use of the a=dressee, It is the property of Jeffrey Epstein Unauthorized use, di=closure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictl= prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this communication
in error, p=ease notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, =nd destroy this
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachm=nts. copyright -all rights reserved
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