
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 15, 2017 7:52 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Dr Magnani 

bleaching is not acceptable . sorry , pay it but its out o= hand 

On We=, Nov 15, 2017 at 2:43 PM, Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com wrote: 

bella sent me the latest batch of medical bills for girlsjust wanted to confirm that you do not want to see these 
and that bella s=ould pay all medical once girls confirm for accuracy 

<=div> 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor 
Ne 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Bella Klein <=r> 
Subject: Dr Magnani 

Date: November 15, 2017 at 2:29:34 PM EST 
<=s . an> 
To > > 

Cc: Richard Kahn > ><=r> 

NM, 
please confirm your visit to Dr. M=gnani 

Tha=k you, 

EFTA_R1_01731824 
EFTA02566576



Bella 

=br> 

=AO please note 

The information contained in this=communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, mayconstitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the=addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or=copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibite= and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in err=r, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com<=a>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including=all attachments. 
copyright -all rights reserved 
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