From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Wednesday, Movember 15, 2017 10:09 PM
To: Moam Chomsky
Subject: Re: Qutstanding invoices

tell debra ok for rich kahn to pay, and have h=rry agree to new trustee in place of max. everything els= for the
moment irrelevant. . deborah should call =ain and ask for money or she can tell them you wil hire outside counsel.=C2
you understand there is a conflict but she can call =AD

On =ed, Nov 15, 2017 at 3:05 PM, Noam Chomsky _:ﬁpan} wrote:

We were surprised to learn that Rich Kahn raised questions about outstanding invoices. =A0 We did not mention
this to him (or to anyone), as it would be totally i=appropriate. However the main reason why the invoices remain
outstanding i= a combination of factors: our intense schedule that has been even more in=ense than usual in the last
months; we would like to better understand wha= is being charged, since we don't remember having discussed,
requested=or being informed about some items in the invoice. Among other thing= is the lack of information about
exchanges with Max that we haven't b=en copied or informed about, or received any of the copies as we had reque=ted.

You mentioned in your letter of August 31 that=it was a top priority to send us the drafts, but we have not yet
received =hem.

Noam and Valeria

<=iv style="font-size:12.8px">

S Forwarded message -————
From: Deborah Pechet Quinan
Date: Mon, Nov &, 2017=at 3.04 PM
Subject: Outstanding jnvoi

To: "Noam Chomsk

Cc: "Richard Kahn

Dear Moam and Valeria,

In speaking with Richard Kahn this morning he raised=the issue of your outstanding invoices and he has offered
to pay them. =AD Your oldest invoice dates back to July 17th, and we are issu=ng our November invoice today for
October’s time. Including today's invoice of $2,782.50, the outstandin= invoices total $14,217,
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Please let me know if you are in agreement with Rich=rd paying these invoices on your behalf. You will be
receiving today=E2 s invoice in the mail.

Best,
Deborah

=span style="font-size:10.5pt;color:black™=

Deborah Pec=et Quinan, Esg. LL.M.

Shareholder</=pan>

Chair, Trusts=& Estates Group =A0

<https://maps.google.com/?q=255+5tate+Street,+ Tth+Floor%C2%A0%7=%C2%A0Boston,+MA+02109&entry=g
mail&source=g>
<https://maps.google.com/?q=255=5tate+5treet,+ 7th+Floor$C2%A0%7 C+%3Chttps://maps.google.com/?q%30255%2B8
Sta=e%2B5treet,%2B7th%2BFloor%%25C2%25A0%257C%25C2%25A0Boston, %2BMA%2B02109%26e=try%:3Dgmail %2650
urce%3Dg%3E%C2%A0Boston, +MA+02109+%3Chttps://maps.google.c=m/?q%3D255%2B5tate%2BStreet, %2 B7th%2BF|
oor¥e25C2%25A0%257C%25C2%25A0Boston, =2 BMA%:2B02109%26entry%3 Dgmail%26source%3Dgi3 E&entry=gmail &s
ource=3Dg> |
<https://maps.google.com/?q=255+5tate+5treet, + 7th+Floorf%C2%A=5%7C%C2%A0Boston, +MA+02109&entry=gmail &sou
rce=g> Boston, MA 02109
<https://maps.google.=om,/?q=255+5tate+5treet,+ 7th+Floor%C 2%A0%7C%C2%A0Boston, +MA+02 109&ent=y=gmail&so
urce=g>

Direct: |
<https://maps.google.com/?q=255+5tate+Street, + Tth+Floo=%C2%A0%7C+%3Chttps: //maps.google.com,/?q%30255%28B
State%:2BStreet, %2B7th%2BFl=or%25C2%25A0%257C%25C2%25A0Boston, %2BMA%2B02109%26entry%%3Dgmail %2650
urce%3=g%3E%C2%A0Boston, +MA+02109+%3Chttps://maps.google.com/?q%3D255%2B5tate%2BS=reet, %2 B7th%2BFI

oorf25C2%25A0¢ < BO2109%26entry%3=gmail¥a26sourcet3Dg%3E&entry=gmail &s
ource=g> Cell:

Assistant - Jayne Mahone

Office: =C2 |

e-mail: | www.riw.com <http://www.riw.com/> =AD0| BIO
<http://ww=.riw.com/attorney/deborah-pechet-quinan/>

NOTICE: This email with its attachments, if any, is intended solely for per=itted use by authorized recipients, If
you are not an authorized recipient=of this email, your retention, transmission, disclosure, or use of this ems=il is
prohibited. If you received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete this email and it= attachments from
your devices and systems.

EFTA_R1_01732334
EFTA02566866



=A0 please note

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a
href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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