From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Thursday, November 16, 2017 7:52 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Invoice - ion nicola

yes

On Thu, Nov 16, 2017 at 1:01 PM, Richard Kahn 7,158.71

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: Re: invoice - ion nicola

Date: November 16, 2017 at 9:=4:43 AM EST

hi rich,

.how are you? i hope everythin= is fine..

as probabl= you know i am at Isj.., today is my last day of work. i am leaving =omorrow
s0 i attached=at this e-mail my invoice ($6,060.00) and some expenses (51,098.71)

<=jv style="margin-top:0px;margin-bottom:0px">the total amount would be $7=158.71
please confirm=/div>

thank you,
ion

EFTA_R1_01732349
EFTA02566875



From:

wrote:

hi rich,
=div style="margin-top:0px;margin-bottom:0px"=

how are you? i hope you are well
i am still in ls]..

i attached to this e-mail=my invoice (58,181) and some expenses receipts (5830.35)
so the total would be 59,011.35
=div style="margin-top:0px;margin-bottom:0px"=

thank you,

on

<invoice_io=_nicola.doc=<IMG_1122.IPG><IMG_1123 JPG><IMG_1124.IPG>=span
id="m_4015926273628562783x_cid:COFFOAB2-2867-478E-876F-
D4DCDAD50862=nys.local"><IMG_1126.JPG=<IMG_1127.IPG=>=

</=lockquote>
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