
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, March 28, 2013 3:07 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: from Sean Lancastor 

That's not fair I was told he would go if they got paid =br> On Thursday, March 28, 2013, wrote: 

Jeffrey 
message below from Sean,. Yesterday we wired the money to cover the=20 576 sales adds for $13,957.79 only, 

not including the $25k you offered Sean for prebuy assistance. 
Sean is unable to travel to Palm beach next week to assist in person with prebuy,. you mentioned that Sean was 

not honest on a previous deal in the past, details I never fully was briefed. 
I stand by your decision to withhold the S76 payment, since Reenstra sold the S76 only 30 days later, Even 

AvPro did not charge for pas= sales advertisements with B727 failure to sell. 
Sean is able to assist via phone with prebuy, I do not feel he shoul= be compensated the $25k if you decide to 

utilize him during the prebuy process unless he make an impact on final outcome. 

My presence during prebuy will make an impact, I will work every angle=to maximize sellers repairs to the GIV. 

thank you, 
Larry 

From: <javascript:_e({}, 'cvml', );> 
Reply-to:=20 <javascript:_e({}, scvmr, 

);> 
direct <javascript:_e({}, Icvmr, 1);=. target=> 

=ww.bristolassociates.com <http:=/www.bristolassociates.com/> <=> 

This=20 message may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.=A0 If you are not the 
intended recipient of the message, please destroy it. =ny unauthorized dissemination, distribution or copying of the 
material in th=s message, and any attachments to the message, is strictly forbidden. (c) 2=12 all rights reserved. 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside i=formation, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the=property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying=of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unla=ful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us=immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtoleevacat=on@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachm=nts. copyright -all rights reserved 
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