
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, April 11, 2013 10:32 PM 
To: •; Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Bell 430 

ok 

On Thu, Apr 11, 2013 at 4:21 PM, c  <mailto > > wrote: 

Jeffrey,. 
Bell is going to work straight to get the helicopter flying by Saturda= morning for me,. so I can arrive late 

Saturday evening into St Thomas. 
-They are completing the invoice for our review, we will have to initi=te the wire before I'm able to depart with 

helicopter. 
My estimate for this annual includes: $92,000.00 
-Annual inspection cost $19,500.00 
-upgrade hydraulic servos $46,414.00 (this is one time only upgrade th=t was due). 
-I will have full break down of other repair items totaling the remain=ng $26,086.00 
-corrosion under passenger window 
-replace nose tire and rim due to corrosion 
-clean and treat tail rotor gears and main gear couplings 

I'll have Rich ready to send Wire Transfer of funds once you appro=e 

thank you, 
Larry 

=br>*********************************************************.*
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