
From: Richard Kahn AMMINIMMIS> 
Sent: Thursday, November 9, 2017 10:06 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Fwd: Outstanding invoices 

when i pay invoices shall i pay from HBRK or my personal =ccount? 
please advise 
thank =ou 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel
fa 
ce 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Deborah Pechet Quinan 

Subject: =/b>RE: Outstanding =nvoices 

Date: =/b>November 9, 2017 at 3:44:09 PM =ST 

To: =/b>Richard Kah 

Thank you Richard. I have not =eceived any response from Noam and Valeria on this. Could you ask =hem to 
send me a quick note in this regard in reply to my email =elow? I will send you the wire instructions once they have 
done =o. 

Best, 
Deborah 

Deborah Pechet Quinan, Esq. 11.M. 
Shareholder 
Chair, Trusts & Estates =roup 
255 State Street, 7th Floor I Boston, MA 02109 
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Direct: 
Assistant - =ayne Mahoney 
Office I Fax: 
e-mail: 

From: Richard Kahn lmailtc 
Sent: Thursday, November 09, 2017 =:03 PM 
To: Deborah Pechet Quinan 
Subject: Re: Outstanding =nvoices 

www.riw.com <http://www.riw.com/> I BIO 

can you please send me payment =nstructions via check or wire as i would like to pay today 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 
t 

On Nov 6, 2017, at 3:04 =M, Deborah Pechet Quinan a wrote: 

Dear Noam =nd Valeria, 

In speaking with Richard Kahn this morning he raised the =ssue of your outstanding invoices and he has 
offered to pay them. =our oldest invoice dates back to July 17th, and =e are issuing our November invoice today for 
October's =ime. Including today's invoice of $2,782.50, the =utstanding invoices total $14,217. 

Please let me know if you are in =greement with Richard paying these invoices on your behalf. You =ill 
be receiving today's invoice in the mail. 

Best, 
Deborah 

Deborah =echet Quinan, Esq. LL.M. 
Shareholder 
Chair, =rusts & Estates Group 

109 
D25ir5ecStt:1 1.0.111. 
Assistant - Jayne Mahoney: -
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Office: 
e-mail. I www.riw.com <http://www.riw.com/> I BIO 
<image .gi 

NOTICE: This email with its attachments, if any, is intended =olely for permitted use by authorized 
recipients. If you are not an =uthorized recipient of this email, your retention, transmission, =isclosure, or use of this 
email is prohibited. If you received this =mail in error, please notify the sender and delete this email and its =ttachments 
from your devices and systems. 

NOTICE: This email with its =ttachments, if any, is intended solely for permitted use by authorized =ecipients. If 
you are not an authorized recipient of this email, your =etention, transmission, disclosure, or use of this email is 
prohibited. =f you received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete =his email and its attachments from 
your devices and =ystems. 
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