
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, November 9, 2017 10:07 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Outstanding invoices 

hbrk 

> wrote: 

when i pay invoices shall i pay from HBRK =r my personal account? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington 

<https://maps.google=com/?q=575+LexingtonVoC2V0A0Avenue+4th+Floor+New+York,+NY%C2%A010022&e=try=gmail& 
source=g> Avenue 4th Floor 
<https://maps=google.com/?q=575+Lexington%C2%A0Avenue+4th+Floor+New+Vork,+NY%C2V0A01002=&entry=gmail& 
source=g> 

New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Deborah Pechet Quinan <=a href="mailt 

Subject: 

Thank you Richard. I have not received any response from Noam =nd Valeria on this. Could you ask 
them to send me a quick note in th=s regard in reply to my email below? I will send you the wire instru=tions once they 
have done so. 

Best, 
Deborah 
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Deborah Pechet Quinan, Esq. LL.M. 
Shareholder 
Chair, Trusts &am=; Estates Group 
255 State Street, 7th Fl=or =a 

href="https://maps.google.com/?q=255+State+Street,+7th+Floor%C2%A0%7=V0C2%A0Boston,+MA+02109&entry=gmail 
&source=e> I Boston, MA 02109 
<https://maps.google.com/?q=2=5+State+Street,+7th+Floor%C2%,40%7C%C2%A0Boston,+MA+02109&entry=gmail=am 
p;source=g> 

Direct: 
Assistant - Jayne Mahone 

=ww.riw.com <http://www.rk.com/> I =C24O31O <http://wwwsiw.corniattorney/deborah-pechet-quinank 

From: <=span>Richard Kahn [mailti 
Sent: Thursday, November 09, 2017 3:03 PM 
To:=/b> 
Subject: Re: Outstanding invoices 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington 

<https://maps.goog=e.com/?q=57S+LexingtonVoC2V0A0Avenue+4th+Floor+New+York,+NY%C2%A010022&=entry=gmail 
&source=g> Avenue 4th Floor 
<https://ma=s.google.com/?q=575+Lexington%CrA,A0Avenue+4th+Floor+New+York,+NY%C2%A010=22&entry=gmail&s 
ource=g> 

New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fa 
ce 

On Nov 6, 2017= at 3:04 PM, Deborah Pechet Quinan 

aiv> 
Dear Noam and Valeria, 
4>=A0 
In speaking with Richard Kahn this morning=he raised the issue of your outstanding invoices and he has 

offered to pay=them. Your oldest invoice dates back to July 17th, and we=are issuing our November invoice today for 
October's time. l=cluding today's invoice of $2,782.50, the outstanding invoices tot=l $14,217. 

Please let me know if you are in agreement with Richard paying then= invoices on your behalf. You will 
be receiving today's invo=ce in the mail. 

Best, 
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Deborah 
=p class="MsoNormal" style="margin:0in 0in 12pt;font-size:11pt;font-fam=ly:Calibri,sans-

serif"> 
Deborah Pechet Quina=, Esq. LL.M. 
Sha=eholder 
Chair, Trust= & Estates Group 
255 State Street, 7th Floor 

chttps://maps.google.com/?q=3D255+State+Street,+7th+Floor%C2V0A0ch7C%C2%A0Boston,+MA+02109&entry=g=ail&s 
ource=g> I 
<https://maps.google.com/?q=255+State+Stre=t,+7th+Floor%C2%A0%7OY0C2%A0Boston,+MA+02109&entry=gmail&so 
urce=3Dg> Boston, MA 02109 
<https://maps.google.comllq=255+State+S=reet,+7th+Floor%C2V0A0%7CV0C2%A0Boston,+MA+02109&entry=gmail&so 
urc==g> 

Direct 
Assistan 
Of=ic: 

=ayne Mahone 

4>=A0 
e-mail 

chttp://www.riw.com/attorney/deborah-pechet-quinarg> 
<i mage001.gif>=/u> 

=ww.riw.com <http://www.ri=.com/> l*.A0BIO 

NOTICE: This email wi=h its attachments, if any, is intended solely for permitted use by authori=ed 
recipients. If you are not an authorized recipient of this email, your =etention, transmission, disclosure, or use of this 
email is prohibited. lf=you received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete this=email and its 
attachments from your devices and systems. 

NOTICE: This email=with its attachments, if any, is intended solely for permitted use by auth=rized 
recipients. If you are not an authorized recipient of this email, yo=r retention, transmission, disclosure, or use of this 
email is prohibited.=If you received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete t=is email and its attachments 
from your devices and systems. 

4=lockquote> 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, m=y be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and=is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or=any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you hav= received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by<=r>return e-mail or by e-mail to 

jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communicati=n and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rig=ts reserved 
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