
From: Ann Rodriquez 
Sent: Friday, June 22, 2018 12:56 AM 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 
Cc: Rich Kahn; 
Subject: Chris update 

Hey Bossman, 

Chris said that he couldn't make it to the farm this week but h='s going down Monday morning the 25th. 

Chris asked that we pay him first since he noticed the change in his chec= on Tuesday? 
He said that it's a 4hr. drive and he would n=ed to spend the night in Lake Worth, FL that's why his invoice is f=r 3 days 

Chris Invoice amount for 3 days: $1=050.00 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

Ann R. 

Begin=forwarded message: 

From:=Ann Rodriquez 
Date: June 19, 2018 at 
To:</=> Brice Gordon 
Cc: "jef :jeevacation@gmail.=om», 

Richard Kahn < 
Subjec 

=13» 

Chris just calle= to check in... 
I asked him if he could drive down to south coast growe=s to find the 4 palms for the courtyard, seagrape trees 

and other nice tree= available. He said yes 

I asked him to send u= pictures immediately 

An= R. 

On Jun 19, 2018, at 9:00 AM, Brice Gordon > wrote: 

EFTA_R1_01743484 
EFTA02573469



Good Morning 

Medjools Palms? 
The tallest they can ship is 35ft clear trunk, approx 45 total he=ght 

adiv> 
Sea Grapes 
=div class="gmail_default" style="font-size:small">Any thing from 3 gall=n shrubs to fully grown trees 

Will forward photos and pricing once received 

Can I send Drone shots of Main Compound to inst=ll department? 

O= Thu, Jun 14, 2018 at 4:27 PM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>= wrote: 

<=iv dir="ltr"> 
Brice Gordon 

Stanley, NM 

ISJ-GSJ, USVI 
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