
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, November 2, 2017 8:02 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: 3 month apt rent 

ok 

On Thu, Nov 2, 2017 at 3:56 PM, Bella Klein &=t; > wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Please confirm payment to Julia in=the amount of $3,610.68 for August, September and October rent 
<=1" 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From:

Subject: </=pan>3 month apt rent 

Date: November 2, 2017 at 3:27:49 PM=EDT 

To: Jeffre Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com», Bella Klein 

Reply-To 

Hello Be=la , 
I just got to 301 and there's apt rent is 3,610.68$ 
P=ease transfer to the Bank of America, 
Pic is attached 
Thank you 
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-- at> 

please note 

T=e information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be a=torney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is int=nded only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 

communication or any pa=t thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have recei=ed this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
retu=n e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication an= all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights r=served 
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