From: Noam Chomsky <[

Sent: Friday, October 27, 2017 &55 PM
To: jeffrey E.; Valeria Chomsky
Subject: Fwd: trust

So what next?

--=-=----- Forwarded message ----------

From: Max Kohlenberg < - -
Date: Fr=, Oct 27, 2017 at 1:21 PM

Subject: Re: trust

To: Noam Chomsky < <mailto = >
Cc: &qu=t;Deborah Pechet Quinan, Esg." >

Hello Noam -
I'm afraid | cannot send the money you have requested without furt=er discussion with you and | also feel | cannot have
such a discussion wit= you without Deborah'’s knowledge and participation, as she is your att=rney. Please also note

that any distributions from the trusts would also involve Harry, who is the co-trustee of the tru=ts.

As you will see, | have again copied Deborah on my reply. | will=be glad to follow up with a meeting or a call when |
return, next week.

Thanks,

Max

Sent from my Verizo=, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

-—--—- Jriginal message -

From: Noam chomsky </ SN < - S >
Date: 10/27/17 5:14 PM (GMT+00:00)

To: Max Kohlenberg <
Subject: Fwd: trust

There seems to be some confusion. | was responding to your lette= of Oct. 16, in which you said you would be getting
back to me the next da=. That was the last time we were in touch. Since | didn't =ear from you, | wrote again, last night.

My letter to you explained the reasons for my request for a distributi=n from the marital trust. To repeat, "l would like
to get on wi=h my life and work without delay. I've worked hard for 70 years,=put away a substantial sum of money. |
surely have the right to access it."
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| don't see what further explanation is necessary, or why it is ne=essary to bring Deborah into this. | could add that as |
approach 90= having worked hard for 70 years and put away a substantial sum of money, = not only have the right to
some peace and tranguillity to go on with my life and work, but also to do so without fac=ng an inquisition.

If you are unable to transfer the money this week , could you please detail=for me the reasons behind the decision.
Thanks,
Noam

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Max Kohienbers [N - >

Date: Wed, Oct 25, 2017 at 10:55 PM
Subject: RE: trust

To: Noam Chomsky < <mailto > >
Cc: Deborah Pechet Quinan < 5

Good morning (from S5=otland) Noam —

=/span>

When we were last in=touch on this | replied with a cc to Deborah (who | have copied agai= here) and | understood that
you, she and Valeria had discussed my need (as trustee) to know something more about the background for this =equest
and your anticipated needs going forward. Deborah got back to=me and indicated that the call she and | had tentatively
scheduled was bei=g cancelled.

=/span>

If you would like me=to reschedule a call with Deborah, or a meeting, I'd be glad to do=that. I'll be back on Tuesday.
=/span>

My best,</=>

=/span>

Max

=/span>

From: Noam Chomsky=(mailtf N - |

Sent: Thursday, October 26, 2017 6:43 AM
To: Max Kohlenberg
Subject: Re: trust
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| didn't hear from you about this, and would lik= to what is happening in this matter. | would like to get on with my=life
and work without delay. I've worked hard for 70 years, put =way a substantial sum of money. | surely have the right to
access it. Could you let me know where this stands.<=>

MNoam

On Mon, Oct 16, 2017 at 9:55 PM, Max Kohlenberg <=a href="{||| GTcNGGGG

target="_blank | ot

Thanks for the quick reply Moam. | will get ba=k to you tomorrow.

Max

S=nt from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

brom: Noam Chorsky < <

Date: 10/16/17 9:14 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: Max Kohlenberg < < o S -
Subject: Re: trust

| meant $500,000.

Moam
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On Mon, Oct 16, 2017 at 9:00 PM, Max Kohlenberg <=a href="{||| |  GTcGGGGEE

targe - ot

Forgive me for asking Noam, but did you mean $500,00=, or $50,0007

Thanks,

Max

S=nt from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

-———- Original message —-—

From: Noam Chomsky <[ <o S -

Date: 10/16/17 6:44 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: Max Konienbers < NN <o [ -

Subject: trust

Dear Max,<=u=

=/span=

I would like to ask =or a distribution from one of the marital trusts, for $500,000, to deal wi=h current expenses of mine.
=/span>

Thanks for your cons=deration

=/span>
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Noam</=pan>
=/span>

=/span>
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