
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, November 6, 2017 8:06 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Outstanding invoices 

pay it, 

On Mon, Nov 6, 2017 at 3:02 PM, Richard Kahn < 
wrote: 

mails 

should i ask for details of amounts ou=standing as no invoices were attached? 
please advise 
thank y=u 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington 

<https://maps.google=com/?q=575+LexingtonVeC2%A0Avenue+4th+Floor+New+York,+NY%C2e/cA010022&e=try=gmail& 
source=g> Avenue 4th Floor 
<https://maps=google.com/?q=575+Lexington%C2%A0Avenue+4th+Floor+New+York,+NY%C2c/cA01002=&entry=gmail& 
source=g> 

New York NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Deborah Pechet Quinan <=a href=' 

Subject: "Noam Chomsky 

<mailtc )" 

target="_blanle 

"Valeria Chomsky
<mailto: > 

Cc: "Richard Kahn <= href="mailt 
<mailto

Dear Noam and Valeria,</=> 

EFTA_R1_01749649 
EFTA02577140



In speaking wi=h Richard Kahn this morning he raised the issue of your outstanding invoic=s and he has 
offered to pay them. Your oldest invoice dates back to =uly 17th, and we are issuing our November invoice today for 
Oct=ber's time. Including today's invoice of $2,782.50, =he outstanding invoices total $14,217. 

=u> 
Please let me know if you are in agreem=nt with Richard paying these invoices on your behalf. You will 

be re=eiving today's invoice in the mail. 

Best, 

 =span style="font-size:10.5pt"> 
Deborah Pechet Quinan, Esq. LL.M. 
Shareholder 
Chair, Trusts & Estates Group I Boston, MA 02109 

chttps://map=.google.com/?q=255+State+Street,+7th+FloorY0C2%A0%7C%C2c/cA0Boston,+MA+0210=&entry=gmail&so 
urce=g> 

Di=ect: 
Assistant - Ja 
Office: 
e-mai=: 

<http://www.riw.com/a orney e ora -pe= et-quinan > 
=/span> 

www.nw.com < : www.nw.com > lO 

2. 

NOTICE: This email with its attachments, if any, is intended=solely for permitted use by authorized 
recipients. If you are not an autho=ized recipient of this email, your retention, transmission, disclosure, or=use of this 
email is prohibited. If you received this email in error, plea=e notify the sender and delete this email and its attachments 
from your de=ices and systems. 

=C24> please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

2 

EFTA_R1_01749650 
EFTA02577141


