From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com=>

Sent: Wednesday, Movember 13, 2013 3:32 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: S10500/K

yes

On Wed, Nov 13, 2013 at 10:11 AM, Richard Kahn <r=chardkahn12@gmail.com <mailto:richardkahn12 @gmail.com: >
wrote:

Please a=vise if attached seat is ok

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 100=2

tel 212-971-1306 <tel:212-971-1306>
fax=646-=50-0954 <tel:646-350-0954>
cell =17-414-7584 <tel:917-414-7584>
=fspan>

Begin forwarded message:
==iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px:margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">From: "Adam
Zygowski " <adam @sportis.com.pl>
Subject: Re: 510500/K

Date: Novermmber 13, 2013 9:09:42 AM EST
To: "Richard Kahn" <richardkahnl2@gmail.c=m>

Cc: "Carlos Rodriguez” <rodz7712@yahoo.com=gt;, "Daphne Wallace" <dlbwallace@gmail.com
<mailto:dlbwallace@gmail.com= target=> >, "Mark Tollison"=<mtollison@h=tmail.com
<mailto:mtollison@hotmail.com= =

Enclosed please find pictures of the seat and boat in=general.
The seat will also have elbow supports, which were being done =hile the pictures were made.
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| will call in a few minutes.

Best regards
Adam Zygowski

Dnia 13-11-2013 o 12:3=:15 Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com
emailto:richardkahn12@gmail.com> > napisat(a):

Can you please send a mock photo
Yes | am free to speak at 9am est
Th=nk you

On 11/13/13 6:19 AM, "Adam Zygowski" <adam@sportis.com.pl=gt; wrote:

Hi,

We are doing our own upholstery fo= the seats.
The cushion will be white, the foundation with suspension m=chanism will
remain black as original.

Can | call you today in 3=5-4 h?

Best regards
Adam Zygowski

Dnia 11-11-2013 o 20:21:34=Richard Kahn <richardkahnl2@gmail.com
<mailto:richardkahnl12@gmail.com=> >
napisat{a):

thanks for the quick feedback

the principal would like the driver and na=igator seats white
please advise on options

thank you

Richard=Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New Yo=k, Mew York 10022

tel 2=2-971-1306 <tel:212-971-1306>
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<mailto:richardkahnl12@gmail.com> >

<mailto:richardkahn12@gmail.com> >

fax 646-350-0954 <tel:646-350-0954=>
cell 917-414-7584 <tel:917-414-7584>

On Nov 11, 2013, at 2:13 PM, "Adam Zygowski " <adam@sportis.com.pl&g=;
wrote:

All seats except of the drive= and navigator seats are oyster white.

The driver seats are extruded in foam and only available in black
color.=br>

We thought to make white covers for them, however the covers would =ot

be tight, and | think better to leave it in original,
What do=you think?

Best regards
Adam Zygowski

Dnia 11-11-2013 o 19:03:09=Richard Kahn <richardkahnl12@gmail.com

napisat{a):

Adam

your last email with pictures had black seats

my understandi=g was that seats would have oyster white upholstery
please advise

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,<=r> New York, New York 10022

tel 212-971-1306 <tel:212-971-1306>

fax 646-350-0954 <tel:646-350-0=54>

cell 917-414-7=84

Begin forwarded message:

From: "A=am Zygowski " <adam @ sportis.com.pl <mailto:adam @sportis.com.pl>

Subject: Re: 510500/K
Date: Septembs=r 16, 2013 3:29:53 AM EDT
To: "Richard Kahn" <richardkahn12@gmail.com

Please see the ch=irs on the enclosed pictures.
The chairs are black in standard, however=we plan to make Oyster
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=mailto:richardkahn12@gmail.com> >

white upholstery for you (the same color as the other seats).

Best r=gards
Adam Zygowski

Dnia 13-09-2013 o 14:26:37 Richard K=hn <richar=kahn12@gmail.com

napisat{a):

Can we please see a previous=y finished S10500 cockpit as we do not

see
chairs for captain

From: Adam Zygowski <adam @sportis.com.pl <mailto:adam@sportis=com.pl>

Date: Thu, 12 Sep 2013 12:30:41 +0200
To: Richard Kahn <richardkahnl2@gmail.c=m>
Subject: 510500/K

Hi Richard,

Enclosed pleas= find our suggestion for the benches inside the

cabin.

On previous boats we made GRP benches, however these ones, made o=
stainless

steel, would be more neat.

In the passage there would =e a foldable seat - the question is do

you need

it?

Best rega=ds
Adam Zygowski

84-207 Koleczkowo

ul. Na Dambnik 22, Bojano Poland

t=I. +48 58 676 01 22 <tel:%2B48%2058%20676%2001%2022> , 676 00 91
mob. + 48 697 250 500 <tel:%2B%2048%20697%20250%20500=

fax: +48 58 676 00 92 <tel:%2B48%2058%20676%=000%2092>
adam@sportis.com.=l <mailto:adam@sportis.com.pl>
www.sportis.com.pl<=a>
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<http:/fwww.sportis.com.pl>
http://www.facebook.com/pages/SPORTIS/151189274950385</=>

<http://www.facebook.com/pages/SPORTIS/151189274950385= target=>
http://twitt=r.com/#!/sportis_sa <http://twitter.com/#!/sportis_sa=

https://plus.google.com,/109174365046263030394<=a>

<=r>
Rejestracja: 5ad Rejonowy Gdarisk Pétnoc Oddziat = Gdarisku,
VIl Wydziat Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475,
kapital =aktadowy: 2.058.170 PLN w catosci opfacony.
Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279

Registered with no: 0000067475 in=Regional Court Gdansk-Polnoc in
Gdansk.
Share capital: 2.058.1=0 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279

<https://plus.google.com/109174365046=63030394>

SPORTIS S.A.

84-207 Koleczkowo

ul. Na Dambnik 22, Bojano P=land

tel. +48 58 67601 22,676 00 91

maob. + 48 697 250 500

fax: =48 58 676 00 92

adam@sportis.com.p= <mailto:adam@sportis.com.pl>
www.sporti=.com.pl <http://www.sportis.com.pl>

http://www.facebook.com/pages/SPORTIS/15118927=950385
<http://www.facebook.com/pages/SPORTIS/151189=74950385>

http://twitt=r.com/#!/sportis_sa <http://twitter.com/#!/sportis_sa>

https://plus.google.com/109174365046263030394<=a>

Rejestracja: 5ad Rejonowy Gdarisk Pétnoc Oddziat = Gdarisku,
VIl Wydziat Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475,

kapitat =aktadowy: 2.058.170 PLN w catosci opfacony.

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279

Registered with no: 0000067475 in=Regional Court Gdansk-Potnoc in
Gdarisk.
Share capital: 2.058.1=0 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279
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<https://plus.google.com/109174365046=63030394>

SPORTIS 5.A.

84-207 Koleczkowo

ul. Na Dambnik 22, Bojano=Poland

tel. +48 5867601 22,676 0091

maob. + 48 697 250 500

fax: +48 58 676 00 92

adam@sportis.com.pl <mailto:adam@sportis.com.pl=
www.sportis,com.pl <http://www.sportis.com.pl>

http://www.facebook.c=m/pages/SPORTIS/151189274950385
<http://www.facebook=com/pages/SPORTIS/151189274950385>

http://twitt=r.com/#|/sportis_sa <http://twitter.com/#!/sportis_sa>

https://plus.google.com/109174365046263030394<=a>

———— -— it = - T

Rejestracja: 5S3d Rejonowy Gdansk Potnoc Oddziat w Gd=nsku,
VIl Wydziat Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475,

kapital zak=B3adowy: 2.058.170 PLN w calosci optacony.
Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279

Registered with no: 0000067475 in=Regional Court Gdansk-Potnoc in Gdansk.
Share capital: 2.058.170 =LN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279

<https://plus.google.com/109174365046=63030394>

SPORTIS 5.A.

84-207 Koleczkowo

ul. Na Dambnik 22, Boj=no Poland

tel. +48 5867601 22, 676 00 91

mob. + 48 697 250 500

fax: +48 58 676 00 92

adam@sportis.com.pl <mailto:adam@sportis.com.pl>
www.sportis.com.pl <http://www.sportis.com.pl>

http://www.facebook.c=m/pages/SPORTIS/151189274950385
<http://www.facebook=com/pages/SPORTIS/151189274950385>

http://twitt=r.com/#!/sportis_sa <http://twitter.com/#!/sportis_sa>

https://plus.google.com/109174365046263030394<=a>
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Rejestracja: Sad Rejonowy Gdansk Potnoc Oddziat w Gdan=ku,
VIIl Wydziat Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475,

kapital zaklad=wy: 2.058.170 PLN w catosci oplacony.

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279

Registered with no: 0000067475 in=Regional Court Gdansk-Potnoc in Gdansk.
Share capital: 2.058.170 =LN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279

<https://plus.google.com/109174365046=63030394>
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=he information contained in this communication is confidential, may be =ttorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the a=dressee. It is the property of Jeffrey Epstein Unauthorized
use, di=closure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictl= prohibited and may be unlawful. If you
have received this communication in error, p=ease notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com, =nd destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all attachm=nts. copyright -all
rights reserved
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