From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, October 17, 2017 9:25 AM
To: Marie-Joseph Experton
Subject: Re: EPSTEIN / Mme Peres "gardienne” - SDC 22 AVENUE FOCH 75116 PARIS

i have been offered the entire 4 th floor aski=g 20 m never has been touched in twenty years at least
On Tue, Oct 17= 2017 at 11:16 AM, Marie-loseph Experton <mjexperton(@ cabine=-experton.com> wrote:

Mot until Mrs Peres has agreed to leave the premises. | will keep you up=ated.

Best regards.

Marie-Joseph Experto=

Avocat au Barreau de Paris établi a Bruxelles=br> Tel._{tel:_

Fax _ctel +

csv I - - [ -
<tel+ [ -

=/font>

From: =effrey E. <j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> >

Sent: 17 October 2017 10:56

To: Marie-Joseph Experton

Subject: Re: EPSTEIN / Mme Peres "gardienne” - SDC 22 AVENUE FOCH 75116 PARIS

ok, butisthere a new person?

On Tue, Oct 17, 2017 at 10:53 AM, Marie-Joseph E=perton <{{ N
<mailto S > \rote:

See attached full report se=t to Darren about your concern relating to Mrs Peres and the lack of
conci=rge at 22 avenue Foch <https://maps.google.com/?g=22+avenue+Foch&entry==mail&source=g>
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Decision to be made =o give Mrs Peres, 45,000 € as extra compensation (for leaving job =nd premises)
on the top of:

(i) the legal compensation =mounting to 31,658 € and

(ii) miscellaneous amounts =uch as compensation for paid vacation, prorata of the 13th month of
salary= for approximately 4,500 €.

Total cost for all the o=ners: +/- 81,500 € (in the range of 12% of this amount for you: +/= 10,000 €},

The owner of the apartment below yours (representing approximately 16=) agreed last night for the
extra amount.

Please advise.

Best regards.=/p>

Marie-Joseph Experto=

Avocat au Barreau de Paris établi & Bruxelles=br> avenue Louise 137
<https://maps.google.com/?q=avenue+=ouise+137&entry=gmail&source=g> boi=e 6

1050 Bruxelles
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