From: richard kohn [

Sent: Friday, June 15, 2018 6:34 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Gemini

ok just spoke with dean from gemini

costs will =e higher as we are being billed for travel (hotel and airfare which we =ever incurred with T5G) there will be a

small =avings on ordering materials will send deposit =oday

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cel

On Jun 15, 2018, at 2:31 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

Approve gemini. Asap

please =ote
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