
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2017 2:53 PM 
To: sEpstein 
Subject: ayroll history 

payroll history: 

first payment was via direct deposit =as 8/25/2017 for the period 8/12-8/25 next payment was via direct deposit was 
9/8/2017 for the =eriod 8/26-9/8 

check had to be issued as First Bank =ebsite did not function on 9 22 2017 for the period =19-9/22 this check is at SIC as 
Fed Ex has =ot been functioning - STC mistakenly did not mak are of =his.. 
check will be sent in first package from STC =his week 

next payment was via direct deposit was =0/6/2017 for the period 9/23-10/6 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor 
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On Oct 8, 2017, at 5:33 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

aid she hasnt gotten paid because of thehurricane? 

please note 

The information contained in this =ommunication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this 
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
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including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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