
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmaiLcom > 
Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2017 4:09 PM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: Jack 

use your card 

On Tue, Oct 10, 2017 at 5:50 PM, Larry Visoski > wrote: 

Jeffrey 
Jack informs his trip to Tallahasse is firm for Thursday at this time,. Bes= price I found in KingAir is $9,200 all in,. 

Including Tax„ 
Jack gave me his AMX card to pay„ should I use My company AMX or use lacks= 

Is this approved? And should I pay? Or use Jacks card,? 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a 
href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and 
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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