From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 7, 2014 9:17 PM
To: Dlugash, Alan
Subject: Re: Fwd:

==iv class="gmail_quote">=0n Thu, Aug 7, 2014 at 2:46 PM, Dlugash, Alan <ADlugash@markspaneth.com
<mailto:ADlugash@markspaneth.com> > wrote:

Debrief?

ALAN DLUGASH CPA</=>
=U>

Marks Paneth LLP

685 Third Avenue, New York, NY, 10017

P, 212.753.8777 <tel:212.753.8777> F. 212.503.6359 <tel:212.503.6359> (C.914 629=5658
E. adlugash@markspaneth=com

From: jeffrey =. [mailto:jeeva=ation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> |
Sent: Thursday, August 07, 2014 9:31 AM

To: Dlugash, Alan

Subject: Fwd:

<=p>

---------- Forwarded =essage ----------

From: Mortimer Zuckerman <mzuckerman@bostonproperties.com
<mailto:mzuckerman@bostonprop=rties.com> >

Date: Wed, Aug 6, 2014 at 5:41 PM

Subject: Re:
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To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> =

Am checking it out
Kris has all the documents if I'm not in town He=is at BXP

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 6, 2014, at 1:06 PM, “jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:je=vacation @gmail.com> > wrote:=u>

the settlement agreement that you gave dlugash , =A0is 2000, is there an amendment. . it says
noth=ng about abigail getting the apt. it talks about adjusted gross esta=e . you are working under some
misconceptions.

please no=e

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof s strictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

This message is a private communication and is intended only for the named =ddressee. It may contain
information which is confidential, proprietary an=/or privileged under applicable law. If you are not the designated
recipie=t, you may not review, copy or distribute this message. If you receive this message in error, please noti=y the
sender by reply e-mail and delete this message from your system.

Thank you.
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please no=e

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTE:

This transmission may contain confidential and/or privileged
information. This information is intended for use by the individual or
entity named above. If you are not the intended recipient, be aware
that any disclosures, copying, distribution or use of the contents of
this information is prohibited. If you have received this transmission
in error, please notify this office immediately.

=C2 please note

The information co=tained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client pr=vileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for

JEE

Unauthorized use,=disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is stri=tly prohibited and may be
unlawful. If you have received this commun=cation in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication =nd all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights=reserved
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