
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, August 7, 2014 11:51 PM 
To: Pe• • Sie• al 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: Mtg 

I assume this means on top of distribution owed. ?=C2 is this the 600k we agreed? 

On Thu, Aug 7, 2014 at 5:07 PM, =eggy Siegal < > wrote: 

Martin: 
I just tried calling on your cell and left a message. Also called your offi=e but did not have your extension and did 

not leave a message. 

When can we speak. I am in France and six hours ahead, but can speak anytim=. 
Peggy 

From: Martin B. O'Connor II [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, August 07, 2014 06:51 PM 
To: Peggy Siegal; George Jim < 

<mailto 
Subject: Mtg 

> > 

All 
Met with Counsel today. Raised numerous deficiencies in the accounting=and his actions 
Made demand for 200000 for a full release and to get us out of his lif=. She indicated that previous demand was 

150000 resulting in the 50000 off=red 
PEGGY-please call me in am so I can update you as to tenor of mtg 
Best 
M 

Martin B. O'Connor, II, Esq. 
O'Connor, Morss & O'Connor, P.C. 
P.O. Box 979 
Elizabeth, New Jersey 07207 

Ma. 
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=C2 please note 

The information co=tained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client pr=vileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for 

JEE 
Unauthorized use,=disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is stri=tly prohibited and may be 
unlawful. If you have received this commun=cation in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication =nd all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights=reserved 
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