
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, October 6, 2017 3:52 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: svet 

Yes 

On Fri,=Oct 6, 2017 at 11:24 AM Richard Kahn <  > wrote: 

ok to release check of 8,333.33 from enhanced? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 
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