
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, August 18, 2014 2:26 AM 
To: Richard Kahn; Ivjet 
Subject: Re: Extra 727 costs Dave and Chris 

i II make final decsions on tues after 727 is back, =C240 thanks 

On Sun, Aug 17, 2014 at 9:01 PM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

Please advise </=iv> 
Thank you 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Larry Visoski 
Date: August 17, 2014 at S:29:1= PM EDT 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Extra 

I forgot to mention to JE that $4000 in hotels for Dave an= Chris +$1600 for food for the eight days 
Apprx $200 per n=ght each for hotels, and $100 per day food for each., 
$14,000 pay 

4,000 hotel 
=span> 1,600 food 
$19,600 total savings i= I send those guys home., 

Rich, Maybe you could send this correction to JE in response to help me o=t 

Sent from my iPhone 

<=blockquote> 

=C24o please note 

The information co=tained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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constitute inside i=formation, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the=property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unla=ful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us=immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtoleevacat=on@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachm=nts. copyright -all rights reserved 

2 

EFTA_R1_01768696 
EFTA02587916


