From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Tuesday, August 26, 2014 3:54 PM
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: Wire

1 On7758111

since darren is not in office and DB re=uires verbal confirm what is best number and time for arthur tender to
ver=ally confirm 2500 euro to assaya

please advise

thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

On Aug 26, 2014, at 8:30 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

please send assaya dadi 2500k euro
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