From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, September 15, 2014 12:53 PM

To: Anthony Barrett

Subject: Re:

Me

On Monday, September 15, 2014, Anthony Barrett :_:r wrote:
Hi Jeffrey,

http://joyceandersonphoto.reachlocal.net

Ci=i windows came last week and should have a proposal this week.

<=r>

nothing on the higher floors available right now - as soon as=something becomes available will let you know.
do=you want me to broach the subject with Mark on trying to divide the assets=- or do want to speak with him.
Anthony

On Sep 15, 2014, at 8:17 AM, jeffrey E. wrote:

does joyce have a portfolio for her =iz or a web page, ? citi windows for karyna, =C2 higher floor apts. please look at
book that karyna will give you re =pt s. .

=C2 please note

The information containe= in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileg=d, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the u=e of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disc=osure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly =rohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communicati=n in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail =o
jeevacation@gmail.com <javascript:_e(%7B%7D,'cvml",'jeevacation@gmail.co=");> , and destroy this =ommunication and
all copies thereof, including all attachments. copyrig=t -all rights reserved

please note

=e information contained in this communication is confidential, may be a=torney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is int=nded only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE
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communication or any pa=t thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have recei=ed this communication
in error, please notify us immediately by retu=n e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication an= all copies thereof, including all attachments.
copyright -all rights r=served
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