Sent: uesday, October 3, 201/ /-

To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Fwd:

Just got it from Rita..

--=------- Forwarded message ---------

From: ita Ste-ancic I
Date: Tue, Oct 3, 2017 at 2:56 PM

Subject:

Hi Elina — my director called me and said th=re was a mistake on the prepayment amount. She is having the account=ng
dept go over all the amounts between the 2 units (280 and 35D) and will=let me know. | counted the days in September
you were there that was used up from the first prepayment you made. =o probably the difference will be for those
days. But | will get the=details and let you know. Sorry.

Rita 5tepancic
SOLO9WST</==>
Solow Realty & Development Company, LLC

420 East 61 <https://maps.google.com/?q=420+East+618&=ntry=gmail&source=g> st Street | 1113 York Avenue | New
York | NY 10065</=>
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