From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Friday, September 19, 2014 6:23 PM
To:

Subject: Re: 9 East 71 Street

ok try

wrote:

The florist is wants to charge 54500 in total= Please see below. Is this Ok?
Sent from my iPhone

Be=in forwarded message:

From:=/b> leda myftara; [ R
Date: September 19, 2014 at 12:26:=5 PM EDT
To: Karyna Shuliak

Cc- . Oscar Mora
.

Subje=t: Re: 9 East 71 Street

Hi Karyna -

Based on your conv=rsation with Oscar, we are ready to do this job tomorrow and as you said t=e
budget for flowers would be approximately 52000, the total cost for this=job will be $4500 plus the sales tax, and would
include:

* Design Fee

* Floral Arrangements- Full f=oral installation in all areas as requested

* Ins=allation Labor Expense

* Dne floral maintenance v=sit

* Delivery / transportation Expenses
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Please note t=at all the vases we'd use for this installation are rentals and belong=to our company's
inventory.

Oscar is offering=to not charge any rental fee as per this installation.

Kindly provide us with the following payment inf=rmation at your earliest convenience. We accept all
major Credit Cards:

* Credit Card Number
* Expiration da=e
* Full billing address

If you'd p=efer, you may call me at_ to pass the payment information
=div>
Please feel free to contact us at anytim=in case you'd have any further questions.

We are looking forward to your response

Kind regards,

Leda
<=y
Leda Myft=raj

Office Coordinator
Oscar Mora Floral Art & Design

New York, NY 10001
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=A0 please note

The information contained in this communicati=n is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute=inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee, =t is the property of JEE Unauthorized
use, disclosure or copying of =his communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may=be unlawful. If you
have received this communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:=eevacation@gmail.com> , and =estroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachm=nts. copyright -all rights reserved
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