From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, September 26, 2014 3:43 PM
To: Eileen Alexanderson

Subject: Re:

no interest

On Fri, Sep 26, 2014 at 11:38 AM, Eileen Alexanderson =span dir:"ltr":-_
I ot

Spoke to Rich D when | go= back, he said she wasn't off on some of the planes purchased bein= in the $30mil
range but that they were used planes.<=p=>

From: jeffre= E. [mailto:jee=acation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> ]
Sent: Friday, September 26, 2014 11:17 AM

To: Eileen Alexanderson

Subject:

http://www.airbus.com/presscentre/pressreleases/press-=elease-detail /detail /new-airbus-aircraft-list-prices-
for-2014/ <http://www.airbus.com/presscentre/pressre=eases/press-release-detail/detail /new-airbus-aircraft-list-
prices-for-2014=>

please no=e

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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=C2 please note

The information co=tained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client pr=vileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for

JEE
Unauthorized use= disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is str=ctly prohibited and may be
unlawful. If you have received this commus=ication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e=mail to

jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereo=,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

<f=iy=
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